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Renewed Framework Contract for Voith Industrial Services with 
Toyota USA in Alabama, Indiana and West Virginia 
 2015-09-22 

• Successful cooperation in the USA for 15 years 
  

In the USA, Toyota partners with Voith Industrial Services Inc. at several 
sites. Recently, the industrial services provider has renewed its framework 
contracts with the car manufacturer in Indiana, Alabama and West Virginia. 
 
At the Toyota plant in Indiana, the contract comprises infrastructural facility 
management, maintenance, repairs as well as technical cleaning activities. 
At the Toyota plant in Alabama and West Virginia, the emphasis is on 
maintenance and technical cleaning services. With tailor-made solutions, 
the experienced industrial services provider creates an ideal work 
environment at both plants, allowing the car manufacturer to concentrate 
on its core business while realizing cost advantages. 
 
“We are proud to continue providing services to Toyota in Alabama, 
Indiana and West Virginia. The cooperation is characterized by great 
mutual trust, appreciation and true partnership. To us, this is the key to 
success”, says David Rohde, General Manager at Voith Industrial Services 
in the USA.   
 
The Toyota Alabama and West Virginia engine plants produce car and 
truck engines and transmissions. The Toyota Manufacturing plant in 
Indiana is located in Gibson County. Today, the Toyota Sequoia, Toyota 
Sienna, Toyota Highlander and Toyota Highlander Hybrid vehicles are 
produced there. 
 
 
About Voith Industrial Services: 
Voith Industrial Services, a Group Division of Voith GmbH, is one of the 
leading providers of technical services for key industries such as 
automotive, energy, chemicals and petrochemicals and of engineering 
services. In 2013/2014, the company generated with its 18,500 employees 
sales of €1.18 billion at its more than 170 locations worldwide. 
  
About Voith: 
Voith sets standards in the energy, oil & gas, paper, raw materials and 
transport & automotive markets. Founded in 1867, Voith has nearly 39,000 



 
 

  

 

 
Press Release Voith Industrial Services at Toyota USA 

  
 

 

Voith Industrial Services 

Holding GmbH & Co. KG 

Meitnerstr. 11 

70563 Stuttgart, Germany 

Telefon +49 711 7841-0 

www.voith.com 
 

page 2 of 2 
 

employees today and generates €5.3 billion in sales. It has locations in 
around 50 countries worldwide and is one of the large family-owned 
companies in Europe. 
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